
From: Jim Meyer
To: sebastianmurillo@idmuruguay.com; agustinamorales@idmuruguay.com
Cc: Omar Petit; Bob Dodson Energy-Parts; Joaquin Mavares; Aaron Twenter
Subject: FW: ORDEN DE COMPRA GEARBOX PARTS...............Revised EPS Quote #EQ30527 REV B attached........
Date: Wednesday, March 24, 2010 11:44:20 AM
Attachments: PURCHASE ORDER.doc

Quote#EQ30527 REV B - Gamatech, S.A.- Gearbox Parts.pdf
Importance: High

Sebastian and Agustina
In accordance with negotiations Omar and I have had with you in
regard to your order and the final revised Energy Parts Solutions
quote #EQ30527 REV B attached.  
We look forward to receiving a revised order from you and we have
also updated the revised quote with your new company name
Gamatech, S.A. and look forward to seeing a Gamatech order and a
Letter of Credit in compliance with our quoted terms. 
It will be our pleasure to start doing business with you. 
Please confirm receipt of the attached revised quote.
Many regards,
Jim
 
J. C. “Jim” Meyer
HIT Parts Manager 
Energy Parts Solutions
2001 ProEnergy Blvd.
Sedalia, Missouri 65301
660-596-7087 office
660-281-5933 cell
660-596-7064 fax

http://www.proenergyservices.com  or  http://www.energy-parts.com

This e-mail is the property of ProEnergy Services, LLC and/or its relevant affiliate and may contain confidential and privileged material for the sole

use of the intended recipient (s). Any review, use, distribution or disclosure by others is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient (or

authorized to receive for the recipient), please contact the sender or reply to ProEnergy Services at chowatt@proenergyservices.com and delete all

copies of the message. This e-mail (and any attachments hereto) are not intended to be an offer (or an acceptance) and do not create or evidence a

binding and enforceable contract between ProEnergy Services LLC (or any of its affiliates) and the intended recipient or any other party, and may not

be relied on by anyone as the basis of a contract by estoppel or otherwise. Thank you.

 
From: Omar Petit 
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2010 5:29 PM
To: Jim Meyer
Subject: FW: ORDEN DE COMPRA GEARBOX PARTS
 
 
Believe it or not…!
 
Can we find out if the price has chance. So I can advise Agustina.
 
Omar Petit
Regional Sales  Manager - Latin America
ProEnergy Services
2001 ProEnergy Blvd.
Sedalia, Missouri 65301
660-281-8588 cell
660-829-5100 office
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		HABILIS S.A.


Avenida Millán 2569


Tel./Fax: 00598 (2) 2009578


C.P. 11800 – Montevideon Uruguay


E-mail: idmuruguay@idmuruguay.com

web: www.idmuruguay.com 





Purchase Order

Montevideo, March 22nd, 2010

Energy Parts Solutions

Mr. Omar Petit

Ref.: Quote #EQ30527, 16 july 2009

Habilis S.A, RUT.214963130016, prompts you to supply us with the following list of Gearbox Parts:

		N°

		Description

		Qty

		Unit Price

		Total Price



		9

		Patín - Plano. Dwg N° 470858-2

		6

		2.517,50

		15.105,00



		10

		Patín - perforado p/ Instrumentos Dwg N° 368730-1

		4

		3.697,50

		14.790,00



		11

		Pino de freno para patin - 0,50  Dia x 1,00 Lg unbraco

		20

		17,50

		350,00



		12

		Placa reten de patines - en partes Dwg N° 470882-4

		2

		3.720,00

		7.440,00



		13

		Placa reten de patines - en partes - perforada para instrumentación Dwg N° 470882-6

		2

		6.165,00

		12.330,00



		14

		Anillo de sellado de aceite - en partes Dwg N° 368732-2

		4

		8.567,50

		34.270,00





TOTAL PRICE = US$ 84.285,00 (eighty four thousand two hundred and eighty five dollars)

TERMS:

· Currency: Dollars


· Invoiced name: Habilis SA   


· Delivery time: 10 – 12 weeks

· Payment: Wire transfer against shipment as arranged.

· Delivery condition: Ex-Work Sedalia

Sincerely,

Agustina Morales

 Habilis S.A.
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660-829-1160 fax

http://www.proenergyservices.com
This e-mail is the property of ProEnergy Services, LLC and/or its relevant affiliate and may contain confidential and privileged material for the
sole use of the intended recipient (s).  Any review, use, distribution or disclosure by others is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient (or authorized to receive for the recipient), please contact the sender or reply to ProEnergy Services at chowatt@proenergyservices.com
and delete all copies of the message. This e-mail (and any attachments hereto) are not intended to be an offer (or an acceptance) and do not create
or evidence a binding and enforceable contract between ProEnergy Services LLC (or any of its affiliates) and the intended recipient or any other
party,  and may not be relied on by anyone as the basis of a contract by estoppel or otherwise. Thank you.

From: Omar Enrique Petit Reyes [mailto:opetitr@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2010 5:28 PM
To: Omar Petit
Subject: Fwd: ORDEN DE COMPRA GEARBOX PARTS
 
 

---------- Mensaje reenviado ----------
De: agustina morales <agustinamorales@idmuruguay.com>
Fecha: 22 de marzo de 2010 15:53
Asunto: ORDEN DE COMPRA GEARBOX PARTS
Para: Omar Petit <opetit@proenergyservices.com>, opetitr@gmail.com
Cc: Iara Arbiza <iaraarbiza@idmuruguay.com>

Omar,
 
Finalmente nos ha llegado la tan esperada orden de compra por los Gearbox Parts. Adjunto la
orden de compra y te pido me confirmes si todos los términos y precios están tal como lo
acordado.
Quedas en contacto con Iara que va a ser quien trabaje con ustedes de aquí en más.
 
Saludos!
 
Agustina Morales
 
Tel: +598 (2) 200 95 78
Cel: +598 (97) 017 634
 
Millán 2569 - Montevideo - Uruguay
 

 

__________ Información de ESET Smart Security, versión de la base de firmas de virus
4966 (20100322) __________

ESET Smart Security ha comprobado este mensaje.
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